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ITEM I All Makes & Models Transmission Parts *
A) Parts
1. Based on Unit Cost Plus vendor markup percentage 15% NO BID +20%
$50,000 Annual Estimated Usage for Parts & Labor 57,500.00
2. Product Identification (Mfg.) Verified by Invoice
ITEMII Labor and Service *
A. Labor rate for services 44.00 NO BID 60.00
B. Up-charge for outside labor, cost plus (not to exceed 20%) 10% NO BID 0%
C. Parts available for pick up (calendar days) 3 days NO BID 5 days
8:00 a.m. - 6:30 a.m. - 8:00 am-5:30 pm
6:00 p.m. 8:00 p.m., 5 days 5 days/week
D. Business hours 5 days 8:00-12:00 p.m./Sat.| 8:00 am-12:00 pm 1 day/week
ITEM I Remanufactured Transmissions
CHEVROLET
4L60E PRICE 1,395.00 1,447.00 1,595.00
6L80E PRICE 1,925.00 2,079.00 2,575.00
6L90E PRICE 1,899.00 2,079.00 2,575.00
4L80E PRICE 1,600.00 1,988.00 2,195.00
DODGE & JEEP
42RLE PRICE 1,583.50 1,919.00 2,195.00
45RFE PRICE 1,625.00 1,900.00 2,475.00
545RFE PRICE 1,950.00 1,900.00 2,475.00
48RE PRICE 1,995.00 2,440.00 2,995.00
68RFE PRICE 2,270.00 2,531.00 2,995.00
AS68RC PRICE 2,225.00 NO BID N/A
AW4 PRICE 1,150.00 1,727.00 2,195.00
FORD
4R100 PRICE 1,895.00 1,954.00 2,475.00
4R70W PRICE 1,495.00 1,682.00 1,895.00
5R55EE PRICE 1,750.00 1,938.00 2,475.00
4R75W PRICE 1,555.00 1,682.00 1,895.00
AODE PRICE 1,000.00 1,530.00 1,895.00
E40D PRICE 1,100.00 1,755.00 2,475.00
AOT PRICE 750.00 1,163.00 1,595.00
TOTAL 1 |ToTAaL 29,162.50 31,714.00 38,975.00
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TOTAL ITEMS | & 111 TOTAL 86,662.50
PRICE SCHEDULES FOR NON SPECIFIED REMANUFACTURED
TRANSMISSION
1. Based on Unit Cost Plus vendor markup percentage 10% 13-20% +20%
2. Product Identification (Mfg.) Verified by Invoice
2-5 Days
Transmission Delivery Turnaround In Days 3 days In Stock 5 days
ITEM IV WARRANTY
Required minimum warranty on Re-built transmissions: (2) years, or 24, 000 miles 3 years 2 years
WARRANTY OFFERED 36,000 miles N/A 24,000 miles
3 years
Required minimum warranty on Remanufactured transmission: (3) years, or 36,000 miles 3 years 100,000 miles 3 years
WARRANTY OFFERED 36,000 miles Parts & Labor 36,000 miles
ITEMV TOWING
Towing: No Charge (Miles) 10 miles NO BID 10 miles
Additional Miles 2.50/mile NO BID 5.00/miles
EXTENSION 1 86,662.50
EXTENSION 2 86,662.50
Net Net 2%
Terms 30 days 30 days 10 days
1
*LOW BIDDER
BIDS INVITATIONS WERE MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:
AAMCO Transmission Jasper Engines SAWS Website

A-Plus Automotive

Atlas Transmission

Coxco Transmission, Inc.
Grande Truck Center

High Tech Transmission, Inc.

Mitson Automotive, Inc.
Mr. Transmission
Smiley's Service
Stewart and Stevenson




